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Sims, Christopher

From: Comcast Account <tfrederick69@comcast.net>
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2025 6:21 PM
To: Andrea Orzehoski; Sims, Christopher
Cc: tdavis@friendswood.net; Phillips, Sonia
Subject: Re: FMA Grant & City Responsiblity in funding

** CAUTION: This email originated from outside of City of League City. Please use caution before clicking any links, downloading 
pictures within email, or responding to unknown senders. Do NOT sign-in with your COLC account for any unexpected items. Please 
contact the Technology Helpdesk (x1380) or forward to HELPDESK@leaguecitytx.gov if in doubt.** 

 
Hi Christopher,  
 
Yes, we at 2108 Knollwood are in agreement to provide the matching costs required on the grant.  
 
Thank you! 
Tracy Frederick  
 
 
 
Sent from my T-Mobile 5G Device 

 
 
-------- Original message -------- 
From: Andrea Orzehoski <andrea.orzehoski@gmail.com>  
Date: 2/27/25 6:15 PM (GMT-06:00)  
To: "Sims, Christopher" <christopher.sims@leaguecitytx.gov>  
Cc: tfrederick69@comcast.net, tdavis@friendswood.net, "Phillips, Sonia" 
<Sonia.Phillips@leaguecitytx.gov>  
Subject: Re: FMA Grant & City Responsiblity in funding  
 
Hi Christopher,  
 
Yes, we at 2114 Cove Park Dr. are in agreement to provide the matching costs required on the grant.  
 
Best, 
Andrea Orzehoski & Aaron Johnson 
 
On Thu, Feb 27, 2025 at 6:06 PM Sims, Christopher <christopher.sims@leaguecitytx.gov> wrote: 

Good evening, everyone, 

  

I am working on our Council item that allows Staff to make the grant application submission and while 
we had conversations where I noted the homeowner would be responsible for any matching costs 
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required on the grant, I did not get that in writing and need to attach that with the council agenda item. 
Please confirm that you are in agreement to provide any matching funds and that you understand that 
the City will only be responsible for assistance in the application process and if awarded, the grant 
administration.  

  

An email response to my email will suffice for an acknowledgment. I apologize for the short notice, but I 
need this confirmation as soon as possible, preferably tomorrow, but no later than Monday, March 3rd. 

  

Thank you, 

Christopher   

  

  

 

Christopher Sims 
Executive Director 
Development Services 

www.leaguecitytx.gov  

. O: 281-554-1440 
City of League City 
500 W Walker St. League City, Texas 77573 
christopher.sims@leaguecitytx.gov  

      . 

CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT 
This message and all attachments are confidential and may be protected by the attorney-client and other 
privileges. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, use, dissemination, 
forwarding, printing, copying, disclosure or distribution of this communication is strictly prohibited and may be 
unlawful. If you believe this message has been sent to you in error, please notify the sender by replying to this 
transmission or by calling the City of League City at 281-554-1000, and destroy all copies of the original 
message. Unless expressly stated in this e-mail, nothing in this message shall be construed as a digital or 
electronic signature. Thank you for your cooperation.  
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Sims, Christopher

From: T Davis <tdavis@friendswood.net>
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2025 7:08 PM
To: Sims, Christopher
Cc: tfrederick69@comcast.net; Andrea Orzehoski; Phillips, Sonia
Subject: Re: FMA Grant & City Responsiblity in funding

** CAUTION: This email originated from outside of City of League City. Please use caution before clicking any links, downloading 
pictures within email, or responding to unknown senders. Do NOT sign-in with your COLC account for any unexpected items. Please 
contact the Technology Helpdesk (x1380) or forward to HELPDESK@leaguecitytx.gov if in doubt.** 

 
Yes, we at 2118 Cove Park Dr. are in agreement to provide the matching costs required on the grant.   
 
Thanks, 
T Davis 
 
On Thu, Feb 27, 2025 at 6:05 PM Sims, Christopher <christopher.sims@leaguecitytx.gov> wrote: 

Good evening, everyone, 

  

I am working on our Council item that allows Staff to make the grant application submission and while 
we had conversations where I noted the homeowner would be responsible for any matching costs 
required on the grant, I did not get that in writing and need to attach that with the council agenda item. 
Please confirm that you are in agreement to provide any matching funds and that you understand that 
the City will only be responsible for assistance in the application process and if awarded, the grant 
administration.  

  

An email response to my email will suffice for an acknowledgment. I apologize for the short notice, but I 
need this confirmation as soon as possible, preferably tomorrow, but no later than Monday, March 3rd. 

  

Thank you, 

Christopher   
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Christopher Sims 
Executive Director 
Development Services 

www.leaguecitytx.gov  

. O: 281-554-1440 
City of League City 
500 W Walker St. League City, Texas 77573 
christopher.sims@leaguecitytx.gov  

      . 

CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT 
This message and all attachments are confidential and may be protected by the attorney-client and other 
privileges. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, use, dissemination, 
forwarding, printing, copying, disclosure or distribution of this communication is strictly prohibited and may be 
unlawful. If you believe this message has been sent to you in error, please notify the sender by replying to this 
transmission or by calling the City of League City at 281-554-1000, and destroy all copies of the original 
message. Unless expressly stated in this e-mail, nothing in this message shall be construed as a digital or 
electronic signature. Thank you for your cooperation.  
 


