Meadows, Christine

From: Debbie Simmons <debbie@simmons10.com>
Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2014 10:22 AM

To: Meadows, Christine

Subject: RE: Info Reguested

Christine - sending this from my personal account since my work account bounced for some reason!

From: Debbie Simmons @ AP [mailto:debbie@anchorpoint.us]
Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2014 9:41 AM

To: 'Meadows, Christine’

Cc: debbie@anchorpoint.us

Subject: Info Requested

Christine —
Good talking with you on the phone and we greatly appreciate your help with the application process.

Our 501c3 # is 27-3828680 (APM Outreach, inc}

We greatly appreciate the city of League City's generosity to us each of our previous years with waiving the cost of the
street closure equipment and manpower. We greatly appreciate you donating that to the event in order to help us have
a successful event. We will plan on {as in previous years) covering the cost of the officers who will work the event. We
do greatly appreciate this partnership.

if you need anything else from me, please let me know.

Pebbie Simmons
Executive Director
Anchor Point
281.236.8792



