Bids Opened on November 24, 2015 at 2:00 p.m.

Present: C. Timmerman

Bid Tabulation: Materials for Annual Line Repairs #16-008

CPR Services & Supplies

HD Supply & Waterworks

Section Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
1A
1/2” SCH 40 100 $0.27 $27.00|1/2” SCH 40 100 $0.21 $21.00
3/4” SCH 40 100 $0.39 $39.00(3/4” SCH 40 100 $0.31 $31.00
1” SCH 40 100 $0.44 $44.00|1” SCH 40 100 $0.35 $35.00
2" SCH 40 200 $1.00 $200.00|2" SCH 40 200 $0.80 $160.00
3”7 SCH 40 200 $2.04 $408.00{3” SCH 40 200 $1.63 $326.00
4” SCH 40 600 $2.98 $1,788.00|4” SCH 40 600 $2.38 $1,428.00
4" C900 400 $2.14 $856.00{4” C900 400 $1.90 $760.00
6” C900 200 $4.26 $852.00(6” C900 200 $3.50 $700.00
8” C900 500 $7.37 $3,685.00(8” C900 500 $6.18 $3,090.00
10” C900 100 $11.07 $1,107.00{10” C900 100 $10.52 $1,052.00
12” C900 100 $15.63 $1,563.00{12” C900 100 $13.20 $1,320.00
3/4” Black Polyethylene 200 psi 500 $0.24 $120.00(3/4” Black Polyethylene 200 psi 500 $0.19 $95.00
1” Black Polyethylene 200 psi 500 $0.38 $190.00{1” Black Polyethylene 200 psi 500 $0.29 $145.00
1 1/2" Black Polyethylene 200 psi 400 $0.78 $312.00(1 1/2" Black Polyethylene 200 psi 400 $0.61 $244.00
2” Black Polyethylene 200 psi 200 $1.32 $264.00|2” Black Polyethylene 200 psi 200 $0.90 $180.00
Sub Total Section 1A $11,455.00 Sub Total Section 1A $9,587.00  $9,587.00
1B
4 foot 3 No bid $0.00 4 foot 3 $1,823.00 $5,469.00|  $5,496.00
5 foot 3 No bid $0.00 5 foot 3 $1,895.00 $5,685.00
Extension Kits: 6 inch 20 No bid $0.00 Extension Kits: 6 inch 20 $130.00 $2,600.00
1 foot 20 No bid $0.00 1 foot 20 $151.00 $3,020.00
2 foot 20 No bid $0.00 2 foot 20 $195.00 $3,900.00




CPR Services & Supplies

HD Supply & Waterworks

Section Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
3 foot 2 No bid $0.00 3 foot 2 $245.00 $490.00
4 foot 2 No bid $0.00 4 foot 2 $268.00 $536.00
5 foot 2 No bid $0.00 5 foot 2 $420.00 $840.00
Flange Kits 3 No bid $0.00 Flange Kits 3 $83.00 $249.00
Bonnet Repair Kits 10 No bid $0.00 Bonnet Repair Kits 10 $34.00 $340.00
Fire Hydrant Wrenches 15 No bid $0.00 Fire Hydrant Wrenches 15 $17.50 $262.50
Sub Total Section 1B $0.00 Sub Total Section 1B $23,391.50| $23,418.50 -$27.00
1C ELBOWI/BENDS 22.5 DEGREE ELBOW/BENDS 22.5 DEGREE
4” C-900 MJ 3 $22.04 $66.12(4” C-900 MJ 3 $38.00 $114.00
6” C-900 MJ 3 $36.00 $108.00{6” C-900 MJ 3 $56.00 $168.00
8” C-900 MJ 3 $56.00 $168.00({8” C-900 MJ 3 $78.00 $234.00
ELBOW/BENDS 45 DEGREE ELBOW/BENDS 45 DEGREE
3/4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.39 $3.90|3/4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.33 $3.30
1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.41 $4.10|1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.39 $3.90
2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.91 $9.10|2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.89 $8.90
3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $3.60 $36.00|3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $3.60 $36.00
4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $6.45 $64.50|4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $6.50 $65.00
6” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $64.80 $324.00(6" CI, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $59.00 $295.00
8” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $86.00 $430.00(8” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $79.00 $395.00
10” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $124.40 $248.80{10” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $114.00 $228.00
12” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $168.00 $336.00{12” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $152.00 $304.00
ELBOW/BENDS 90 DEGREE ELBOW/BENDS 90 DEGREE
3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 30 $0.17 $5.10|3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 30 $0.15 $4.50
1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.29 $2.90|1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.26 $2.60




CPR Services & Supplies

HD Supply & Waterworks

Section Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.77 $7.70|2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.76 $7.60
3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $2.76 $27.60|3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $2.80 $28.00
4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $4.95 $49.50|4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $5.00 $50.00
6” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $74.00 $370.00(6” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $68.00 $340.00
8” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $99.20 $496.00(8” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $91.00 $455.00
10” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $152.80 $305.60{10” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $140.00 $280.00
12” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $194.00 $388.00{12” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $178.00 $356.00
COUPLINGS COUPLINGS
3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.15 $1.50|3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.12 $1.20
1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.24 $2.40|1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.21 $2.10
2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.50 $5.00|2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.45 $4.50
3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 5 $1.57 $7.85|3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 5 $1.60 $8.00
4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $2.28 $22.80|4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $2.30 $23.00
COMPRESSION COUPLINGS Sch 40 COMPRESSION COUPLINGS Sch 40
3/4” x 3/4” 10 $2.56 $25.60|3/4” x 3/4” 10 $2.60 $26.00
1”x 17 10 $3.31 $33.10{1”x 1” 10 $3.30 $33.00
2"x 2 10 $6.82 $68.20(2” x 2~ 10 $6.80 $68.00
3"x 3 10 $16.81 $168.10|3” x 3" 10 $16.00 $160.00
47 x 4 10 $27.66 $276.60(4” x 4~ 10 $27.90 $279.00
TRANSITION COUPLINGS, RUBBER TRANSITION COUPLINGS, RUBBER
2" CIxPVC 10 $1.92 $19.20|2" Cl x PVC 10 $1.90 $19.00
3"CIxPVC 10 $2.60 $26.00{3" CI x PVC 10 $2.60 $26.00
4" ClxPVC 10 $3.26 $32.60|4" Cl x PVC 10 $3.30 $33.00
4" CIxAC 10 $3.52 $35.20{4" CI x AC 10 $3.50 $35.00
6" Cl x PVC 10 $6.97 $69.70|6" Cl x PVC 10 $7.00 $70.00
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6" Cl x AC 10 $7.53 $75.30|6" Cl x AC 10 $7.60 $76.00
8" CIx PVC 10 $10.73 $107.30(8" Cl x PVC 10 $10.80 $108.00
8"CIxAC 10 $11.60 $116.00/8" C1XAC 10 $11.70 $117.00
10" CI x PVC 10 $16.16 $161.60{10" CI x PVC 10 $16.20 $162.00
10" CI x AC 10 $16.16 $161.60{10" CI x AC 10 $16.20 $162.00
12" CI x PVC 10 $18.84 $188.40(12" CI x PVC 10 $19.00 $190.00
12" CI x AC 10 $18.84 $188.40(12" CI x AC 10 $19.00 $190.00
TOP BOLT COUPLING 262 OR TOP BOLT COUPLING 262 OR
EQUIVALENT EQUIVALENT
2”7 6 $77.86 $467.16(2” 6 $77.00 $462.00
3”7 6 $102.71 $616.26(3" 6 $101.00 $606.00
4” 4.25-5.63 6 $128.90 $773.40(4” 4.25-5.63 6 $130.00 $780.00
4” over size 6 No Bid $0.00|4” over size 6 $130.00 $780.00
6” 6.42-7.68 20 $170.20 $3,404.00|6” 6.42-7.68 20 $171.00 $3,420.00
87 8.54-9.84 20 $192.75 $3,855.00|8” 8.54-9.84 20 $194.00 $3,880.00
10” 10.7-12.0 4 $245.23 $980.92(10” 10.7-12.0 4 $247.00 $988.00
10” 10.96-12.66 20 $266.90 $5,338.00/10” 10.96-12.66 20 $269.00 $5,380.00
12” 12.40-13.66 10 $299.66 $2,996.60|12” 12.40-13.66 10 $302.00 $3,020.00
12” over size 13.15-14.41 20 $356.64 $7,132.80|12” over size 13.15-14.41 20 $360.00 $7,200.00
TEE TEE
3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.21 $2.10|3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.19 $1.90
1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.36 $3.60|1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.35 $3.50
2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $1.00 $10.00|2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.95 $9.50
2” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 20 $52.97 $1,059.40|2” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 20 $65.90 $1,318.00
3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $4.00 $40.00{3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $4.00 $40.00
4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $7.24 $72.4014” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $7.40 $74.00
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HD Supply & Waterworks
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6” x 6” x 6” ClI MJ w/ acc pak 10 $108.40 $1,084.00/6” x 6” x 6” Cl MJ w/ acc pak 10 $99.00 $990.00
6” x 8” x 8” Cl MJ w/acc pak 10 $125.22 $1,252.20|6” x 8” x 8” Cl MJ w/acc pak 10 $118.00 $1,180.00
8” x 8” x 8” Cl MJ w/acc pak 10 $148.40 $1,484.00|8” x 8” x 8” ClI MJ w/acc pak 10 $136.00 $1,360.00
10” x 10” x 6” Cl MJ w/acc pak 10 $165.78 $1,657.80|10” x 10” x 6” CI MJ w/acc pak 10 $152.00 $1,520.00
10” x 10” x 8” Cl MJ w/acc pak 10 $186.80 $1,868.00/10” x 10” x 8” CI MJ w/acc pak 10 $172.00 $1,720.00
12" x 12” x 6” Cl MJ w/acc pak 5 $198.00 $990.00{12” x 12” x 6” Cl MJ w/acc pak 5 $182.00 $910.00

12” x 12” x 8” Cl MJ w/acc pak 5 $221.60 $1,108.00| 12" x 12" x 8” Cl MJ w/acc pak 5 $204.00 $1,020.00
ADAPTOR, MALE ADAPTOR, MALE

1/2" Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $0.14 $2.10|1/2" Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $0.12 $1.80
3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $0.17 $2.55|3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $0.14 $2.10
1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $0.26 $3.90|1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $0.23 $3.45
2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $0.51 $7.65|2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $0.49 $7.35
3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $2.08 $31.20|3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 15 $2.10 $31.50
4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $2.64 $26.40]4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $2.70 $27.00
ADAPTOR, MALE, THREADED ADAPTOR, MALE, THREADED

4” Sch 40 10 $2.64 $26.40|4” Sch 40 10 $2.70 $27.00
6” Sch 40 10 $6.90 $69.00({6” Sch 40 10 $7.00 $70.00
8” Sch 40 10 $31.66 $316.60(8” Sch 40 10 $31.00 $310.00
ADAPTOR, FEMALE ADAPTOR, FEMALE

1/2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.19 $1.90|1/2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.15 $1.50
3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 30 $0.22 $6.60|3/4" Sch 40 Glue Joint 30 $0.19 $5.70
1" Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.25 $2.50|1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.22 $2.20
2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 1 $0.55 $0.55|2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $0.49 $4.90
3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $1.70 $17.00|3” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $1.70 $17.00
4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $2.77 $27.70]4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $2.80 $28.00




CPR Services & Supplies

HD Supply & Waterworks

Section Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
6” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $10.19 $101.90{6" Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $10.20 $102.00
CAP, FEMALE THREADED CAP, FEMALE THREADED
2” Brass 10 $10.17 $101.70{2" Brass 10 $11.40 $114.00
2” Galvanized 10 $1.90 $19.00|2” Galvanized 10 $2.30 $23.00
4" Sch 40 10 $3.10 $31.00|4” Sch 40 10 $3.10 $31.00
PLUG, CAST IRON PLUG, CAST IRON
4” MJ w/ acc pak 10 $31.80 $318.00{4” MJ w/ acc pak 10 $12.00 $120.00
4” x 2" Center MJ w/ACC Packs 10 $43.40 $434.00{4” x 2" Center MJ w/ACC Packs 10 $22.00 $220.00
4” Push On 10|- $0.00|4” Push On 10 $15.00 $150.00
6” MJ w/ acc pak 10 $48.10 $481.00(6” MJ w/ acc pak 10 $23.00 $230.00
6” Push On 10|- $0.00|6” Push On 10 $25.00 $250.00
8 “ MJ w/ acc pak 5 $71.70 $358.50(8 “ MJ w/ acc pak 5 $35.00 $175.00
8” Push On 5/- $0.00|8” Push On 5 $35.00 $175.00
10” MJ w/ acc pak 5 $130.60 $653.00{10” MJ w/ acc pak 5 $62.00 $310.00
12” MJ w/ acc pak 2 $132.70 $265.40{12” MJ w/ acc pak 2 $61.00 $122.00
6” x 2" center, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $59.70 $597.00{6” x 2” center, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $34.00 $340.00
8" x 2” center, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $83.30 $416.50(8” x 2” center, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $46.00 $230.00
10” x 2" center, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $142.20 $711.00|10” x 2” center, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $71.00 $355.00 $405.00 -$50.00
12" x 2" center, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $144.30 $288.60|12" x 2" center, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $71.00 $142.00
CROSS CROSS
4” X 4” Sch 40 $8.41 4” X 4” Sch 40 $8.60 $0.00
4” x 4” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak $120.40 4” x 4” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak $110.00 $0.00
6” x 6” Sch 40 10 No Bid $0.00(6” x 6” Sch 40 10 $48.80 $488.00
6” x 6” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $153.60 $1,536.00(6” x 6” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $141.00 $1,410.00
8” x 8” Sch 40 10 No Bid $0.00(8” x 8” Sch 40 10 $78.90 $789.00
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8” x 8” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $169.20 $1,692.00(8” x 8” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $155.00 $1,550.00
10” x 10” Sch 40 10 No Bid $0.00{10” x 10” Sch 40 10 $177.80 $1,778.00
10” x 10" CI, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $260.40 $2,604.00|10” x 10” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $234.00 $2,340.00
12” x 12” Sch 40 10 No Bid $0.00(12” x 12” Sch 40 10 $271.00 $2,710.00
12” x 12” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $400.40 $4,004.00|12” x 12” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $361.00 $3,610.00
REDUCERS REDUCERS
2” x 1” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 No Bid $0.00/2” x 1" Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $1.70 $17.00
4” x 2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 No Bid $0.00|4” x 2” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $10.50 $105.00
6” x 4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $16.00 $160.00{6" x 4” Sch 40 Glue Joint 10 $12.40 $124.00
6” x 4” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $50.00 $500.00(6” x 4” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 10 $46.00 $460.00
8” x 6” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $68.00 $340.00(8” x 6” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $62.00 $310.00
10” x 8” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $92.80 $464.00{10” x 8” Cl, MJ w/ acc pak 5 $85.00 $425.00
12” x 10” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $121.20 $242.40{12” x 10” CI, MJ w/ acc pak 2 $109.00 $218.00
CORPORATION STOPS; MIP x PJx CTS CORPORATION STOPS; MIP x PIx CTS

3/4" x 3/4" x_3/4" (F1100-3) 10 $22.46 $224.60( 3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" (F1100-3) 10 $22.90 $229.00
1”x 17 x 1” (F1100-4) 10 $33.98 $339.80({1” x 1” x 1” (F1100-4) 10 $34.70 $347.00
2” x 27 x 2" (FB1100-7) 10 $162.06 $1,620.60|2” x 2" x 2" (FB1100-7) 10 $165.70 $1,657.00
CORPORATION STOPS; CC x CTS COMP CORPORATION STOPS; CC x CTS COMP
3/4” x 3/4" x 3/4" (F1000-3) 10 $22.46 $224.60(3/4” x 3/4" x 3/4" (F1000-3) 10 $22.90 $229.00
17 x 1" x 1” ( F1000-4) 10 $33.98 $339.80[1” x 1” x 1” ( F1000-4) 10 $34.70 $347.00
CORPORATION STOPS; CC TAPER x PJ x CORPORATION STOPS; CC TAPER x PJ x
CTS CTS
2" x2"x2” 10 $162.06 $1,620.60|2” x 2” x 2” 10 $165.70 $1,657.00
CORPORATION STOPS FITTING CORPORATION STOPS FITTING
ADAPTING FLAIRNTO TO CTS ADAPTING FLAIRNTO TO CTS
¥ " (CO4-33) 20 $11.72 $234.40(% “ (CO4-33) 20 $11.90 $238.00
1'X %" (C04-54) 20 $14.62 $292.40|1°x %" (C04-54) 20 $14.90 $298.00
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1Y% x 1” (C04-54) 20 $20.28 $405.60|1 ¥4” x 1” (C04-54) 20 $18.90 $378.00
17 (C04-44) 20 $17.22 $344.40(1” (C04-44) 20 $17.60 $352.00
11/4” (C04-55) 20 No Bid $0.00|1 1/4” (C04-55) 20 $29.00 $580.00
1%” (CO4-66) 20 $39.81 $796.201 %" (CO4-66) 20 $40.70 $814.00
2" (C04-77) 20 $62.10 $1,242.00(2” (C04-77) 20 $63.00 $1,260.00
CURB STOPS; BALL VALVES; FIP x FIP CURB STOPS; BALL VALVES; FIP x FIP
2" curbstop x CTS PJ 10 No Bid $0.00(2" curbstop x CTS PJ 10 $191.00 $1,910.00
2" curbstop for cast iron box 10 No Bid $0.00|2" curbstop for cast iron box 10 $217.00 $2,170.00
1 1/2" curbstop for cast iron box 10 No Bid $0.00(1 1/2" curbstop for cast iron box 10 $144.00 $1,440.00
3/4 " curbstop for cast iron box single 10 No Bid $0.00(3/4 " curbstop for cast iron box single 10 $47.00 $470.00
3/4 " curbstop for cast iron box double 10 No Bid $0.00(3/4 " curbstop for cast iron box double 10 $25.80 $258.00
5/8” x 3/4" x 3/4" x 3 3/4" (BL11-233 WR) 15 $25.44 $381.60( 5/8” x 3/4" x 3/4" x 3 3/4" (BL11-233 WR) 15 $25.80 $387.00
3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4” x 3 3/8” (B11-333WR) 10 $37.76 $377.60|3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4” x 3 3/8” (B11-333WR) 10 $38.30 $383.00
3/4" x 17 x 1" x 311/16” (B11-344WR) 10 $58.14 $581.40(3/4" x 1" x 1” x 3 11/16” (B11-344WR) 10 $42.50 $425.00
17 x1” x1” x313/16” (B11-444WR) 10 $57.36 $573.60({1” x 1" x 1" x 3 13/16” (B11-444WR) 10 $58.40 $584.00
STRAIGHT BALL VALVE; PIx CTS x MJ STRAIGHT BALL VALVE; PIx CTS x MJ
17 x 1” (BF43-777W) 5 No Bid $0.00(1” x 1” (BF43-777W) 5 $71.60 $358.00
27 x 2" (FG83-777W) 5 No Bid $0.00(2” x 2" (FG83-777W) 5 $216.00 $1,080.00
STRAIGHT METER COUPLING METER STRAIGHT METER COUPLING METER
TRAILS TRAILS
5/8” x 3/4" x 2.5” ( C38-23-2.5) 20 $6.77 $135.40(5/8” x 3/4" x 2.5” ( C38-23-2.5) 20 $6.80 $136.00
3/4" x 3/4" x 3” (C38-23-3) 20 $8.17 $163.40|3/4" x 3/4" x 3" (C38-23-3) 20 $8.30 $166.00
1” x 2.625” (C38-44-2.625) 20 $10.42 $208.40(1” x 2.625” (C38-44-2.625) 20 $10.50 $210.00
PACK JOINT COUPLINGS $0.00([PACK JOINT COUPLINGS
17 X %" X 3/4" wye (Y66-243) 10 No Bid $0.00]1” X 4" X 3/4" wye (Y66-243) 10 $54.00 $540.00
17 x 17 x 1” tee (T444-444) 10 $32.46 $324.60[1” x 1” x 17 tee (T444-444) 10 $33.20 $332.00
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PACK JOINT EXPANSION COUPLING PACK JOINT EXPANSION COUPLING
EXPANSION WHEEL ASSEMBLY FOR 1" EXPANSION WHEEL ASSEMBLY FOR 1"
CAST IRON BOX $0.00{CAST IRON BOX
3/4" standard (EC-23) 10 $13.95 $139.50{3/4" standard (EC-23) 10 $14.00 $140.00
PACK JOINT COUPLING PVC x CTS $0.00[PACK JOINT COUPLING PVC x CTS
2" x 2" (C74-77) 10 $77.12 $771.20(2” x 2" (C74-77) 10 $78.80 $788.00
PACK JOINT COUPLINGS MIP x CTS $0.00[PACK JOINT COUPLINGS MIP x CTS
3/4" x 3/4" (C84-33) 15 $10.30 $154.50(3/4" x 3/4" (C84-33) 15 $10.50 $157.50
3/4" x 17 (C84-34) 15 $11.40 $171.00(3/4" x 1" (C84-34) 15 $11.60 $174.00
1” x 3/4" (C84-43) 15 $11.25 $168.75|1" x 3/4" (C84-43) 15 $11.50 $172.50
1”7 x 1” (C84-44) 15 $12.19 $182.85[1” x 1” (C84-44) 15 $12.40 $186.00
2" x 2” (C84-77) 15 $48.69 $730.35|2” x 2” (C84-77) 15 $49.80 $747.00
PACK JOINT COUPLINGS MIP x PVC PACK JOINT COUPLINGS MIP x PVC
3/4" x 3/4" (C87-33) 10 $13.65 $136.50(3/4" x 3/4" (C87-33) 10 $13.90 $139.00
3/4" x 17 (C87-34) 10 $23.16 $231.603/4" x 1" (C87-34) 10 $20.50 $205.00
17 x 17 (C87-44) 10 $21.28 $212.80(1” x 17 (C87-44) 10 $21.70 $217.00
27 x 2" (C87-77) 10 $60.83 $608.30(2” x 2” (C87-77) 10 $62.00 $620.00
PACK JOINT COUPLINGS CTS x CTS PACK JOINT COUPLINGS CTS x CTS
3/4" x 17 (C44-34) 40 $14.60 $584.00(3/4" x 1” (C44-34) 40 $14.90 $596.00
3/4” x 3/4" (C44-33) 40 $12.54 $501.60(3/4” x 3/4" (C44-33) 40 $12.80 $512.00
17 x 17 (C44-44) 10 $14.35 $143.50|1” x 1” (C44-44) 10 $14.60 $146.00
17 x 1 1/4" (C44-45) 10 $23.16 $231.60|1” x 1 1/4" (C44-45) 10 $21.20 $212.00
11/4" x 1 1/4" (C44-55) 10 $24.77 $247.70|1 1/4" x 1 1/4" (C44-55) 10 $24.80 $248.00
11/2" x 1 1/2" (C44-66) 10 $48.01 $480.10(1 1/2" x 1 1/2" (C44-66) 10 $49.00 $490.00
27 x 27 (C44-77) 10 $64.83 $648.30(2” x 2" (C44-77) 10 $66.20 $662.00
PACK JOINT COUPLINGS CTS X CTS 90 PACK JOINT COUPLINGS CTS X CTS 90
DEGREE BEND BRASS FITTING DEGREE BEND BRASS FITTING
¥a"x 3/4” (L44-33) 20 $16.19 $323.80(%4"x 3/4” (L44-33) 20 $16.50 $330.00




CPR Services & Supplies

HD Supply & Waterworks

Section Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
3/4" x 17 (L44-34) 20 No Bid $0.00/3/4" x 17 (L44-34) 20 $18.60 $372.00
1”7 x 17 (L44-44) 20 $20.84 $416.80(1” x 1” (L44-44) 20 $21.20 $424.00
1% “x11/4" (L44-55) 20 No Bid $0.00|1 ¥ “x 1 1/4" (L44-55) 20 $37.60 $752.00
11/2" x 1 1/2" (L44-66) 20 $66.87 $1,337.40(1 1/2" x 1 1/2" (L44-66) 20 $68.30 $1,366.00
27 x 2" (L44-77) 20 $135.31 $2,706.20(2” x 2" (L44-77) 20 $138.00 $2,760.00
PACK JOINT COUPLINGS CTX X CTS (WYE’S PACK JOINT COUPLINGS CTX X CTS (WYE’S
PART # Y44-243-Y68-337 PART # Y44-243-Y68-337
17 x 3/4" (Y44-243) 20 $25.96 $519.20|1” x 3/4" (Y44-243) 20 $26.00 $520.00
11/2" x 1" (Y44-264) 20 $62.80 $1,256.00|1 1/2" x 1" (Y44-264) 20 $64.00 $1,280.00
27 x 17 (Y48-274) 20 $72.60 $1,452.00(2” x 1" (Y48-274) 20 $53.00 $1,060.00
PACK JOINT COUPLINGS FIP x PVC PACK JOINT COUPLINGS FIP x PVC
3/4” x 3/4" (C17-33) 10 $13.55 $135.50(3/4” x 3/4" (C17-33) 10 $13.80 $138.00
3/4" x 1" (C17-34) 10 No Bid $0.00|3/4" x 1" (C17-34) 10 $21.80 $218.00
PACK JOINT COUPLINGS FIP x PE PIPE PACK JOINT COUPLINGS FIP x PE PIPE
3/4” x 3/4" (C16-33) 10 $13.33 $133.30(3/4” x 3/4" (C16-33) 10 $13.30 $133.00
3/4" x 17 (C16-34) 10 $18.54 $185.40(3/4" x 1" (C16-34) 10 $18.50 $185.00
17 x 1” (C16-44) 10 $17.06 $170.60({1” x 1” (C16-44) 10 $17.00 $170.00
2" x 2" (C16-77) 10 $67.72 $677.20(2” x 2" (C16-77) 10 $67.00 $670.00
PACK JOINT COUPLINGS FIP x CTS PACK JOINT COUPLINGS FIP x CTS
3/4" x 3/4" (C14-33) 10 $10.83 $108.30{3/4" x 3/4" (C14-33) 10 $11.00 $110.00
17 x 1” (C14-44) 10 $14.69 $146.90(1” x 1” (C14-44) 10 $15.00 $150.00
27 x 2” (C14-77) 10 $50.90 $509.00{2"” x 2” (C14-77) 10 $52.00 $520.00
INSERT STIFFNERS INSERT STIFFNERS
3/4" x 1” 20 No Bid $0.00|3/4" x 1” 20 $1.00 $20.00
3/4” x 3/14" 20 $0.99 $19.80(3/4” x 3/4" 20 $1.00 $20.00
17 x1” 20 $1.05 $21.00{1” x 1” 20 $1.05 $21.00
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17 x11/4" 20 No Bid $0.00|1" x 1 1/4" 20 $1.30 $26.00
11/2” x11/2" 20 $1.44 $28.80(1 1/2” x 1 1/2" 20 $1.45 $29.00
2" x 2" 20 $1.44 $28.80(2” x 2” 20 $1.45 $29.00
PIPE RESTRANS C-900, DUCT IRON, A/C PIPE RESTRANS C-900, DUCT IRON, A/C
WATER AND SEWER LINES WATER AND SEWER LINES
4” elcen clamp w/lugs 20 $26.04 $520.80(4” 20 $20.70 $414.00
6” elcen clamp w/lugs 20 $27.10 $542.00(6" 20 $25.90 $518.00
8 elcen clamp w/lugs 20 $28.13 $562.60(8” 20 $35.00 $700.00
10" elcen clamp w/lugs 20 $30.21 $604.20|10” 20 $60.00 $1,200.00
12" elcen clamp w/lugs 20 $35.42 $708.40(12” 20 $63.90 $1,278.00
PJ COUPLINGS; IP x PVC; PJ BOTH ENDS PJ COUPLINGS; IP x PVC; PJ BOTH ENDS
3/4" x 3/4" (C57-33) 10 $16.61 $166.10(3/4" x 3/4" (C57-33) 10 $16.60 $166.00
SLEEVES, CI, MJ w/ acc pak SLEEVES, CI, MJ w/ acc pak
2” x 7" Short 10 No Bid $0.00|2” x 7" Short 10 $43.00 $430.00
2” x 12" Long 10 $43.20 $432.00{2” x 12” Long 10 $64.00 $640.00
4” x 7” Short 10 $36.80 $368.00{4” x 7” Short 10 $33.00 $330.00
4” x12” Long 10 $44.40 $444.00(4” x 12” Long 10 $40.00 $400.00
6” X 7” Short 10 $58.40 $584.00(6" x 7” Short 10 $53.00 $530.00
6” x 12” Long 10 $69.20 $692.00(6” x 12” Long 10 $63.00 $630.00
8” X 7” Short 10 $71.60 $716.00{8” x 7” Short 10 $65.00 $650.00
8” x 12” Long 10 $100.40 $1,004.00(8” x 12” Long 10 $92.00 $920.00
10” x 12” Long 10 $126.00 $1,260.00|10” x 12” Long 10 $109.00 $1,090.00
12” x 12” Long 10 $158.40 $1,584.00|12” x 12” Long 10 $118.00 $1,180.00
REPAIR COUPLINGS C-900 REPAIR COUPLINGS C-900
67 x7” 10 $33.56 $335.60(6” x 7” 10 $28.80 $288.00
6” x 127 10 No Bid $0.00|6” x 12” 10 $28.80 $288.00
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8" x7” 10 $80.92 $809.20(8” x 7" 10 $66.80 $668.00
8”7 x12” 10 No Bid $0.00(8” x 12” 10 $66.80 $668.00
10" x 12” 10 $170.28 $1,702.80(10” x 12” 10 $132.00 $1,320.00
12”7 x 127 10 $248.69 $2,486.90(12” x 12” 10 $193.00 $1,930.00
GASKETS - RUBBER YOKE Gaskets - Rubber Yoke
3/4" iron box (GT 118) 500 No Bid $0.00(3/4" iron box (GT 118) 500 $0.21 $105.00
1” iron box (GT123) 500 No Bid $0.00(1” iron box (GT123) 500 $0.24 $120.00
2 1/2" replacement gaskets 500 No Bid $0.00(2 1/2" replacement gaskets 500 $4.50 $2,250.00
GASKETS - RUBBER FLANGE, BLACK Gaskets - Rubber Flange Gasket, Black
1 1/2" rubber gasket 200 $0.70 $140.00{1 1/2" rubber gasket 200 $0.56 $112.00
2”7 200 $0.82 $164.00(2” 200 $0.97 $194.00
FIBER GASKETS, BLACK FIBER GASKETS, BLACK
3/4" x 1/16” 1000 $0.08 $80.00|3/4" x 1/16” 1000 $0.09 $90.00
3/4" x 1/132” 1000 $0.07 $70.00|3/4" x 1/32” 1000 $0.09 $90.00
1”7 x 1/16” 1000 $0.10 $100.00{1” x 1/16” 1000 $0.10 $100.00
17 x 1/32” 1000 $0.10 $100.00{1” x 1/32” 1000 $0.10 $100.00
PROBING ROD WI/TIPS SS $0.00[PROBING ROD WI/TIPS SS
Probing rod tips 100 $5.94 $594.00|Probing rod tips 100 $5.50 $550.00
Gray hand pump 10 $36.47 $364.70(Gray hand pump 10 $25.70 $257.00
4 feet 10 $24.75 $247.50(4 feet 10 $20.80 $208.00
5 feet 10 $26.44 $264.40(5 feet 10 $22.20 $222.00 $220.00 $2.00
6 feet 10 $27.56 $275.60(6 feet 10 $23.20 $232.00
HYMAX Flanged Adapter, or equivalent HYMAX Flanged Adapter, or equivalent
157 10 $91.27 $912.70{ 1.5” 10 $92.50 $925.00
27 10 $97.66 $976.60(2” 10 $92.50 $925.00
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3”7 10 $138.95 $1,389.50(3” 10 $131.00 $1,310.00
4 10 $178.29 $1,782.90|14” 10 $169.00 $1,690.00
4” 0O.S. 10 $223.23 $2,232.30/4” O.S. 10 $169.00 $1,690.00
6” 10 $227.12 $2,271.20|6” 10 $214.00 $2,140.00
8” 10 $309.62 $3,096.20(8” 10 $293.00 $2,930.00
10” 10 $524.64 $5,246.40|10” 10 $496.00 $4,960.00
10” O.S. 10 $524.64 $5,246.40(10” O.S. 10 $496.00 $4,960.00
127 10 $605.65 $6,056.50( 12” 10 $573.00 $5,730.00
12” O.S. 10 $605.65 $6,056.50| 12” O.S. 10 $573.00 $5,730.00
MEGALUG FLANGES MEGALUG FLANGES
4" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $27.63 $276.30(4" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $20.70 $207.00
6" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $34.60 $346.00(6" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $26.00 $260.00
8" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $46.68 $466.80(8" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $35.00 $350.00
10" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $81.28 $812.80{10" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $60.00 $600.00
12" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $85.75 $857.50|12" Megalug flange ACC Pack 10 $63.00 $630.00
2" Flanged x CTS PJ 10 No Bid $0.00|2" Flanged x CTS PJ 10 $216.00 $2,160.00
2" Flanged x PVC PJ 10 No Bid $0.00|2" Flanged x PVVC PJ 10 $224.00 $2,240.00
2" Flanged x FIP 10 $42.11 $421.10(2" Flanged x FIP 10 $192.00 $1,920.00
2"FIPXCTSPJ 10 $60.39 $603.90|2" FIP X CTS PJ 10 $191.00 $1,910.00

Sub Total Section 1C $142,225.61 Sub Total Section 1C $162,882.00 $162,930.00 -$48.00
1D Service Saddles Service Saddles
27 x 3/4" 5 $21.33 $106.65(2” x 3/4" 5 $18.80 $94.00
2"x1” 5 $21.33 $106.65[2” x 1” 5 $18.80 $94.00
37 x3/4" 5 $22.20 $111.00(3” x 3/4" 5 $19.00 $95.00
3" x1” 5 $22.20 $111.00{3” x 1” 5 $19.00 $95.00
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4” x 3/4” 10 $21.04 $210.40(4” x 3/4” 10 $20.40 $204.00
4" x1” 10 $21.04 $210.40(4” x 1” 10 $20.40 $204.00
6” x 3/4” 5 $24.64 $123.20(6 x 3/4” 5 $23.60 $118.00
67 x1” 5 $24.64 $123.20(6” x 1” 5 $23.60 $118.00
6” x2” 5 $28.95 $144.75(6” x 2” 5 $27.70 $138.50
8” x 3/4" 5 $29.25 $146.25(8” x 3/4" 5 $28.00 $140.00
8" x1” 5 $29.25 $146.25(8” x 1” 5 $28.00 $140.00
87 x2” 5 $34.92 $174.60(8” x 2” 5 $36.60 $183.00
10” x 3/4" 5 $32.50 $162.50{10” x 3/4" 5 $31.10 $155.50
10" x 1” 5 $32.50 $162.50{10” x 1” 5 $31.10 $155.50
10" x 2” 5 $39.67 $198.35[10” x 2” 5 $38.00 $190.00
12” x 3/4” 5 $37.57 $187.85(12” x 3/4” 5 $36.00 $180.00
12”7 x 1” 5 $37.57 $187.85(12” x 1” 5 $36.00 $180.00
127 x 2”7 5 $47.35 $236.75|12” x 2” 5 $44.20 $221.00

Sub Total Section 1D $2,850.15 Sub Total Section 1D $2,705.50,  $2,705.50
1E Tapping Sleeves Tapping Sleeves
6” X 6” 5 $318.84 $1,594.20(6” x 6” 5 $322.00 $1,610.00
10” x 6” 5 $332.57 $1,662.85|10” x 6” 5 $336.00 $1,680.00
10” x 8” 5 $434.29 $2,171.45|10” x 8” 5 $438.00 $2,190.00
127 x 6” 5 $351.98 $1,759.90|12” x 6” 5 $355.00 $1,775.00
8" x 4” 5 $296.00 $1,480.00(8” x 4” 5 $299.00 $1,495.00
8”7 x6” 5 $323.42 $1,617.10(8” x 6” 5 $326.00 $1,630.00
8”7 x8” 5 $405.70 $2,028.50(8” x 8” 5 $409.00 $2,045.00
127 x 8” 5 $448.00 $2,240.00|12” x 8” 5 $452.00 $2,260.00
Sub Total Section 1E $14,554.00 Sub Total Section 1E $14,685.00 $14,685.00
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1F Full Circle Clamps Full Circle Clamps
12” x 12” x 13.44-14.20 AIC 10 $169.76 $1,697.60|12” x 12” x 13.44-14.20 AIC 10 $168.00 $1,680.00
12” x 12” x 13.20-13.50 C-900 10 $95.22 $952.20{12” x 12" x 13.20-13.50 C-900 10 $94.00 $940.00
12” x 7.5” x 13.44-14.20 AIC 10 $98.53 $985.30(12” x 7.5” x 13.44-14.20 A/C 10 $99.00 $990.00
12” x 7.5” 13.20-13.50 C-900 10 $59.16 $591.60{12” x 7.5 13.20-13.50 C-900 10 $59.00 $590.00
12” x 15” 13.20-13.50 A/C 10 $118.33 $1,183.30(12” x 15” 13.20-13.50 A/C 10 $119.00 $1,190.00
12" x 7.5" 12.006-13.02 SCH.40 10 $57.48 $574.80(12" x 7.5" 12.006-13.02 SCH.40 10 $56.90 $569.00
12" x 7.5" 12.06-13.20 DI 10 $59.16 $591.60{12" x 7.5" 12.06-13.20 DI 10 $58.50 $585.00
10” x 12”7 11.24-11.95 A/IC 10 $147.93 $1,479.30(10” x 12 11.24-11.95 A/C 10 $146.00 $1,460.00
10” x 12 11.10-11.40 C-900 10 $86.71 $867.10{10” x 12” 11.10-11.40 C-900 10 $85.80 $858.00
10” x 7.5” 11.24-11.95 A/C 10 $83.98 $839.80{10” x 7.5” 11.24-11.95 A/C 10 $83.00 $830.00
10” x 7.5” 11.10-11.40 C-900 10 $52.45 $524.50{10” x 7.5 11.10-11.40 C-900 10 $51.90 $519.00
10”x 15” 11.24-11.95 A/C 10 $164.39 $1,643.90|10”x 15" 11.24-11.95 A/C 10 $162.00 $1,620.00
8” x 12”7 9.27-9.67 AIC 10 $75.42 $754.20( 8” x 12”7 9.27-9.67 AIC 10 $74.60 $746.00
8” x 7 1/2" 8.99-9.39 C-900 10 $43.10 $431.00( 8” x 7 1/2" 8.99-9.39 C-900 10 $42.60 $426.00
8” x 7 1/2" 8.54-8.94 SCH 40 10 $41.77 $417.70( 8” x 7 1/2" 8.54-8.94 SCH 40 10 $41.30 $413.00
8” x 7 1/2" 9.27-9.67 AIC 10 $45.09 $450.90( 8” x 7 1/2" 9.27-9.67 A/IC 10 $44.60 $446.00
8” x 15”7 9.27-9.67 AIC 10 $89.00 $890.00( 8” x 15” 9.27-9.67 A/IC 10 $88.00 $880.00
6” x 12" 7.45-7.85 A/IC SMOOTH 10 $76.66 $766.60( 6” x 12" 7.45-7.85 A/C SMOOTH 10 $75.80 $758.00
6” x 12”7 7.05-7.45 AIC ROUGH 10 $74.54 $745.40( 6” x 12” 7.05-7.45 A/IC ROUGH 10 $73.70 $737.00
6” x 7 1/2" 6.84-7.24 SCH 40 10 $45.85 $458.50( 6” x 7 1/2" 6.84-7.24 SCH 40 10 $45.30 $453.00
6” x 7 1/2" 7.05-7.45 AIC 10 $46.54 $465.40( 6” x 7 1/2" 7.05-7.45 AIC 10 $46.00 $460.00
6” x 15" 7.45-7.85 A/C SMOOTH 10 $88.55 $885.50( 6” x 15" 7.45-7.85 A/C SMOOTH 10 $87.00 $870.00
6” x 15" 7.05-7.45 AIC ROUGH 10 $86.34 $863.40( 6” x 15” 7.05-7.45 A/IC ROUGH 10 $85.40 $854.00
4” x 71/2" 4.45-4.73 SCH 40 10 $37.54 $375.40( 4” x 7 1/2" 4.45-4.73 SCH 40 10 $37.10 $371.00
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4” x 7 1/2" 4.95-5.53 AIC 10 $59.39 $593.90( 4” x 7 1/2" 4.95-5.53 A/C 10 $58.70 $587.00
4” x 7 1/2" 4.95-5.14 C-900 10 $39.27 $392.70( 4” x 7 1/2" 4.95-5.14 C-900 10 $38.80 $388.00
4” x 7 %" 4.95-5.53 AIC 10 $59.39 $593.90( 4” x 7 %" 4.95-5.53 A/IC 10 $58.70 $587.00
3”x71/2"3.13-3.50 SCH 40 10 $33.36 $333.60( 3” x 7 1/2" 3.13-3.50 SCH 40 10 $33.00 $330.00
37" x71/2"3.45-3.70 CI 10 $34.17 $341.70( 3" x 7 1/2" 3.45-3.70 CI 10 $33.80 $338.00
37 x71/2"3.74-4.17 AIC 10 $57.08 $570.80( 3” x 7 1/2" 3.74-4.17 AIC 10 $56.40 $564.00
37 x 157 3.74-4.17 AIC 10 $111.04 $1,110.40| 3” x 15" 3.74-4.17 AIC 10 $109.00 $1,090.00
2" x71/2” 2.35-2.63 CI 25 $28.76 $719.00f 2” x 7 1/2” 2.35-2.63 ClI 25 $28.40 $710.00
27 x 12" 2.35-2.63 CI 25 $51.06 $1,276.50| 2" x 12" 2.35-2.63 Cl 25 $50.50 $1,262.50
11/4" x 6” Cl 10 $27.97 $279.70( 1 1/4" x 6” ClI 10 $27.60 $276.00
11/2" x6” PVC 10 $28.48 $284.80| 1 1/2" x 6” PVC 10 $28.00 $280.00
1”x3”PVC 10 $13.71 $137.10{ 1" x 3" PVC 10 $13.50 $135.00
3/4" x 3" PVC 10 $12.96 $129.60| 3/4" x 3" PVC 10 $12.80 $128.00

Tappped Repair Clamps Tappped Repair Clamps

4” 4,74-5.14 1-514-7.5-CC3 10 $57.41 $574.10(4” 4.74-5.14 f1-514-7.5-CC3 10 $56.00 $560.00
4” 4.74-5.14 f1-5.14-7.5-CC4 10 $57.41 $574.10(4” 4.74-5.14 f1-5.14-7.5-CC4 10 $56.00 $560.00
4" 4.95-5.35 F1-5.35-7.5-CC3 10 $57.83 $578.30{4” 4.95-5.35 F1-5.35-7.5-CC3 10 $56.00 $560.00
4” 4.96-5.35 F1-5.35-7.5-CC4 10 $57.83 $578.30(4” 4.96-5.35 F1-5.35-7.5-CC4 10 $56.00 $560.00
4" 5.22-5.62 F1-5.62-7.5-CC3 10 $58.32 $583.20(4"” 5.22-5.62 F1-5.62-7.5-CC3 10 $57.00 $570.00
47 5.22-5.62 F1-5.62-7.5-CC4 10 $58.32 $583.20(4” 5.22-5.62 F1-5.62-7.5-CC4 10 $57.00 $570.00
6" 5.95-6.35 F1-6.35-7.5-CC3 10 $58.33 $583.30{6" 5.95-6.35 F1-6.35-7.5-CC3 10 $57.00 $570.00
6” 5.95-6.35 F1 6.35-7.5-CC4 10 $58.33 $583.30(6" 5.95-6.35 F1 6.35-7.5-CC4 10 $57.00 $570.00
6” 6.56-6.96 F1-6.96-7.5-CC3 10 $63.43 $634.30(6" 6.56-6.96 F1-6.96-7.5-CC3 10 $62.00 $620.00
6” 6.84-7.24 F1-7.24-7.5-CC3 10 $64.41 $644.10(6” 6.84-7.24 F1-7.24-7.5-CC3 10 $63.00 $630.00
6" 6.84-7.24 F1-7.24-7.5-CC4 10 $64.41 $644.10(6” 6.84-7.24 F1-7.24-7.5-CC4 10 $63.00 $630.00
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6” 7.05-7.45 F1-7.45-7.5-CC3 10 $65.10 $651.00(6 7.05-7.45 F1-7.45-7.5-CC3 10 $63.00 $630.00
6” 7.05-7.45 F1-7.45-7.5-CC4 10 $65.10 $651.00(6” 7.05-7.45 F1-7.45-7.5-CC4 10 $63.00 $630.00
6" 7.45-7.85 F1-7.85-7.5-CC3 10 $66.30 $663.00(6” 7.45-7.85 F1-7.85-7.5-CC3 10 $64.00 $640.00
6” 7.45+7.85 F1-7.85-7.5-CC4 10 $66.30 $663.00(6” 7.45+7.85 F1-7.85-7.5-CC4 10 $64.00 $640.00
8” 7.95-8.35 F1-8.35-7.5-CC3 10 $53.65 $536.50(8"” 7.95-8.35 F1-8.35-7.5-CC3 10 $52.00 $520.00
8” 7.95-8.35 F1-8.35-7.5-CC4 10 $53.65 $536.50(8” 7.95-8.35 F1-8.35-7.5-CC4 10 $52.00 $520.00
8” 8.54-8.94 F1-8.94-7.5-CC3 10 $56.35 $563.50(8"” 8.54-8.94 F1-8.94-7.5-CC3 10 $55.00 $550.00
8” 8.54-8.94 F1-8.94-7.5-CC4 10 $56.35 $563.50(8” 8.54-8.94 F1-8.94-7.5-CC4 10 $55.00 $550.00
8” 8.99-9.39 F4-9.36-7.5-CC3 10 $57.70 $577.00{8"” 8.99-9.39 F4-9.36-7.5-CC3 10 $56.00 $560.00
8” 8.99-9.39 F1-9.39-7.5-CC4 10 $57.70 $577.00(8” 8.99-9.39 F1-9.39-7.5-CC4 10 $56.00 $560.00
87 9.27-9.67-F1-9.67-7.5-CC3 10 $58.64 $586.40(8” 9.27-9.67-F1-9.67-7.5-CC3 10 $57.00 $570.00
87 9.27-9.67 F1- 9.67-7.5-CC4 10 $58.64 $586.40(8” 9.27-9.67 F1- 9.67-7.5-CC4 10 $57.00 $570.00
87 9.70-10.10 F1-10.10-7.5-CC3 10 $61.60 $616.00(8” 9.70-10.10 F1-10.10-7.5-CC3 10 $60.00 $600.00
87 9.70-10.10 F1-10.10-7.5-CC4 10 $61.60 $616.00{8” 9.70-10.10 F1-10.10-7.5-CC4 10 $60.00 $600.00
10” 10.64-11.04 F1-11.04-7.5-CC3 5 $65.95 $329.75(10” 10.64-11.04 F1-11.04-7.5-CC3 5 $64.00 $320.00
10” 10.64-11.04 F1-11.04-7.5-CC4 5 $77.22 $386.10(10” 10.64-11.04 F1-11.04-7.5-CC4 5 $64.00 $320.00
10”7 11.04-11.44 F1-11.44-7.5-CC3 5 $67.07 $335.35(10” 11.04-11.44 F1-11.44-7.5-CC3 5 $65.00 $325.00
10” 11.04-11.44 F1-11.44-7.5-CC4 5 $67.07 $335.35(10” 11.04-11.44 F1-11.44-7.5-CC4 5 $65.00 $325.00
10" 11.34-11.74 F1-11.74-7.5-CC3 5 $70.90 $354.50(10” 11.34-11.74 F1-11.74-7.5-CC3 5 $69.00 $345.00
10” 11.34-11.74 F1-11.74-7.5-CC4 5 $70.90 $354.50(10” 11.34-11.74 F1-11.74-7.5-CC4 5 $69.00 $345.00
10" 11.74-12.15 F1-12.15-7.5-CC3 5 $71.04 $355.20(10” 11.74-12.15 F1-12.15-7.5-CC3 5 $69.00 $345.00
10” 11.75-12.15 F1-12.15-7.5-CC4 5 $71.04 $355.20(10” 11.75-12.15 F1-12.15-7.5-CC4 5 $69.00 $345.00
127 12.00-12.40 F1-12.40-7.5-CC3 5 $73.23 $366.15(12” 12.00-12.40 F1-12.40-7.5-CC3 5 $71.00 $355.00
12” 12.00-12.40 F1-12.40-7.5-CC4 5 $73.23 $366.15(12” 12.00-12.40 F1-12.40-7.5-CC4 5 $71.00 $355.00
12" 12.62-13.02 f1-13.02-7.5-CC3 5 $73.81 $369.05(12” 12.62-13.02 f1-13.02-7.5-CC3 5 $72.00 $360.00
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12" 12.62-13.02 f1-13.02-7.5-CC4 5 $73.81 $369.05(12” 12.62-13.02 f1-13.02-7.5-CC4 5 $72.00 $360.00
12” 13.10-13.50 1-13.50-7.5-CC3 5 $74.30 $371.50{12” 13.10-13.50 1-13.50-7.5-CC3 5 $72.00 $360.00
127 13.10-13.50 F1-13.50-7.5-CC4 5 $74.30 $371.50{12” 13.10-13.50 F1-13.50-7.5-CC4 5 $72.00 $360.00
12” 13.40-13.80 F1-13.80-7.5-CC3 5 $75.95 $379.75(12” 13.40-13.80 F1-13.80-7.5-CC3 5 $74.00 $370.00
12” 13.40-13.80 F1-13.80-7.5-CC4 5 $75.95 $379.75(12” 13.40-13.80 F1-13.80-7.5-CC4 5 $74.00 $370.00
12” 13.70-14.10 F1-14.10-7.5-CC3 5 $75.95 $379.75(12” 13.70-14.10 F1-14.10-7.5-CC3 5 $74.00 $370.00
127 13.70-14.10 F1-14.10-7.5-CC4 5 $75.95 $379.75(12” 13.70-14.10 F1-14.10-7.5-CC4 5 $74.00 $370.00
12” 14.00-14.40 F1-14.40-7.5-CC3 5 $76.10 $380.50{12” 14.00-14.40 F1-14.40-7.5-CC3 5 $83.00 $415.00
12" 14.00-14.40 F1-14.40-7.5-CC4 5 $76.10 $380.50(12” 14.00-14.40 F1-14.40-7.5-CC4 5 $83.00 $415.00
Coupling Leak Clamps for SCH-40 Couplings Coupling Leak Clamps for SCH-40 Couplings
2" 2.38 FCC-2.38 5 $32.85 $164.25(2” 2.38 FCC-2.38 5 $33.00 $165.00
2% 2.88 FCC-2.88 5 $34.10 $170.50(2 ¥ 2.88 FCC-2.88 5 $38.00 $190.00
3”7 3.50 FCC-3.50 5 $37.60 $188.00{3"” 3.50 FCC-3.50 5 $38.00 $190.00
3% 4.00 FCC-4.00 5 $40.15 $200.75(3 ¥ 4.00 FCC-4.00 5 $40.00 $200.00
4" 4.50 FCC-4.50 5 $42.37 $211.85(4” 4.50 FCC-4.50 5 $42.00 $210.00
6” 6.63 FCC-6.63 5 $52.25 $261.25(6” 6.63 FCC-6.63 5 $52.00 $260.00
8” 8.63 FCC-8.63 5 $58.31 $291.55(8” 8.63 FCC-8.63 5 $58.00 $290.00
Bell Joint Leak Clamps for Cast Iron or C-900 Bell Joint Leak Clamps tor Cast Iron or C-

PVC 900 PVC

4" 4.80-5.00 FBC-500 5 $76.44 $382.20|4” 4.80-5.00 FBC-500 5 $74.00 $370.00
6” 6.90-7.10 FBC-710 5 $84.20 $421.00(6” 6.90-7.10 FBC-710 5 $83.00 $415.00
8”7 9.05-9.30 FBC-930 5 $116.33 $581.65|8” 9.05-9.30 FBC-930 5 $115.00 $575.00
10” 11.10-11.40 FBC-1140 5 $146.20 $731.00{10” 11.10-11.40 FBC-1140 5 $144.00 $720.00
12” 13.20-13.50 FBC 1350 5 $158.11 $790.55[12” 13.20-13.50 FBC 1350 5 $156.00 $780.00

Bell Joint Leak Clamps tor Standard Steel
Bell Joint Leak Clamps for Standard Steel Size Size
4" 4.50 FBC-450 5 $91.01 $455.05(4” 4.50 FBC-450 5 $77.00 $385.00
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6” 6.63 FBC-663 5 $100.22 $501.10(6" 6.63 FBC-663 5 $84.00 $420.00
8” 8.63 FBC-863 5 $138.67 $693.35(8” 8.63 FBC-863 5 $116.00 $580.00
10” 10.75 FBC-1075 5 $173.82 $869.10{10” 10.75 FBC-1075 5 $145.00 $725.00
12”7 12.75 FBC 1275 5 $188.54 $942.70(12” 12.75 FBC 1275 5 $156.00 $780.00
Bolt Extension Kits for Bell Clamps Bolt Extension Kits for Bell Clamps
FBC-450 FBC-863 BEK-1-4 5 No Bid $0.00(FBC-450 FBC-863 BEK-1-4 5 $5.00 $25.00
FBC-930 BEK-2-4 5 No Bid $0.00(FBC-930 BEK-2-4 5 $7.60 $38.00
FBC-1140 FBC1275 BEK-2-6 5 No Bid $0.00(FBC-1140 FBC1275 BEK-2-6 5 $10.50 $52.50
Misc Repair Clamps Misc Repair Clamps
12"x 6" 14.00914.40 10 $62.52 $625.20(12"x 6" 14.00914.40 10 $61.00 $610.00
12"x 6" 14.00914.40 10 $62.52 $625.20{12"x 6" 14.00914.40 10 $61.00 $610.00
24” x 12.5"tripleband clamp 25.60-26.80 10 $469.05 $4,690.50|24” x 12.5 tripleband clamp 25.60-26.80 10 $459.00 $4,590.00
26" bell joint clamp 25.80-26.32 10 $453.75 $4,537.50/26" bell joint clamp 25.80-26.32 10 $444.00 $4,440.00
10” x 10” double band 11.60-12.40 10 $137.80 $1,378.00|10” x 10” double band 11.60-12.40 10 $134.00 $1,340.00
10" x 7.5" 11.75-12.15 10 $54.65 $546.50{10" x 7.5" 11.75-12.15 10 $53.00 $530.00
10" x 12.5" 11.75-12.15 10 $93.56 $935.60{10" x 12.5" 11.75-12.15 10 $91.00 $910.00
8” x7.579.70-10.10 10 $48.79 $487.90(8” x 7.5” 9.70-10.10 10 $47.00 $470.00
47 x7.5"4.74-5.14 10 $30.96 $309.60(4” x 7.5" 4.74-5.14 10 $30.00 $300.00
3t04” x 12.5" 3.96-4.25 10 $48.40 $484.00(3 to 4” x 12.5" 3.96-4.25 10 $47.00 $470.00
37 x7.5"3.73-4.00 10 $27.51 $275.10(3” x 7.5" 3.73-4.00 10 $27.00 $270.00
2.5"x 12.5" 2.70-3.00 10 $42.26 $422.60(2.5"x 12.5" 2.70-3.00 10 $41.00 $410.00
2.5"x 7.5" 2.70-3.00 10 $25.60 $256.00(2.5"x 7.5" 2.70-3.00 10 $26.00 $260.00

Sub Total Section 1F $71,874.70 Sub Total Section 1F $70,171.00 $69,121.00 $1,050.00
1G Meter Boxes & Lids Meter Boxes & Lids
3/4” x 3/4” Single Service Meter box to be Ford 3/4” x 3/4” Single Service Meter box to be Ford
Yoke Box or approved equivalent. Body and lid Yoke Box or approved equivalent. Body and lid
to be CIYM 241-233-T (angle in — straight out). 20 $154.34 $3,086.80|to be CIYM 241-233-T (angle in — straight out). 20 $140.00 $2,800.00
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1” Single Service Yoke Box YL111-444-T or 1” Single Service Yoke Box YL111-444-T or
approved equivalent. Body and lid to be cast iron. 20 $312.28 $6,245.60|approved equivalent. Body and lid to be cast iron. 20 $289.00 $5,780.00
3/4" x 3/4” Double Service Meter box to be Ford 3/4" x 3/4” Double Service Meter box to be Ford
Double Gulf Box DG 248-243-T or approved Double Gulf Box DG 248-243-T or approved
equivalent. Body and lid to be Cl (Angle in — equivalent. Body and lid to be Cl (Angle in —
straight out). 20 $280.08 $5,601.60|straight out). 20 $256.00 $5,120.00
2” Protector Meter Box w/ Epoxy Coat — Body 2” Protector Meter Box w/ Epoxy Coat — Body
and lid to be cast iron, epoxy coated. FPMB7EP- and lid to be cast iron, epoxy coated. FPMB7EP-
T. 20 No Bid $0.00|T. 20 $551.00 $11,020.00
Epoxycoated Cl lid for 2" meter box 20 $81.95 $1,639.00|Epoxycoated Cl lid for 2" meter box 20 $77.00 $1,540.00
Cl lid for 1" box with reader 20 $55.27 $1,105.40|ClI lid for 1" box with reader 20 $93.00 $1,860.00
Cl lid for single 3/4" box with reader 20 $53.45 $1,069.00|Cl lid for single 3/4" box with reader 20 $84.00 $1,680.00
Cl lid for double 3/4" box with reader 20 $49.20 $984.00|Cl lid for double 3/4" box with reader 20 $77.00 $1,540.00
Single concrete boxes with reader lid 20 $72.35 $1,447.00|Single concrete boxes with reader lid 20 $64.00 $1,280.00
Double concrete box with reader lid 20 $65.25 $1,305.00|Double concrete box with reader lid 20 $63.00 $1,260.00
Grade adjuster for 1" ClI box 20 No Bid $0.00(Grade adjuster for 1" CI box 20 $23.00 $460.00
Grade adjuster for 3/4" CI box 20/No Bid $0.00(Grade adjuster for 3/4" CI box 20 $23.00 $460.00
Rubber spacers with 2" hole 20/No Bid $0.00(Rubber spacers with 2" hole 20 $5.50 $110.00
Plastic DFW lid with reader 20 $6.21 $124.20(Plastic DFW lid with reader 20 $8.00 $160.00
Plastic Brooks lid with reader 20 No Bid $0.00(Plastic Brooks lid with reader 20 $8.00 $160.00
Concrete lid, double with reader 20 $24.57 $491.40(Concrete lid, double with reader 20 $39.00 $780.00
Concrete lid, single with reader 20 $26.70 $534.00|Concrete lid, single with reader 20 $36.00 $720.00
Meter Box Keys MBLK 1 No Bid $0.00(Meter Box Keys MBLK 1 $7.00 $7.00
Combination Yoke Box/Dallas Lid Key Part Combination Yoke Box/Dallas Lid Key Part
#9505 1 No Bid $0.00|#9505 1 $28.00 $28.00
Ball VValve Yoke Box Wrench-SAVW 1 No Bid $0.00(Ball VValve Yoke Box Wrench-SAVW 1 $8.00 $8.00
Yoke Box Valve Wrench-MBVW 1 No Bid $0.00| Y oke Box Valve Wrench-MBVW 1 $26.00 $26.00
2" backflow preventer for 3" construction meter 1 $469.06 $469.06 (2" backflow preventer for 3" construction meter 1 $499.00 $499.00
Coupling assembly for 3" construction meter 1 No Bid $0.00|Coupling assembly for 3" construction meter 1 $39.00 $39.00

Sub Total Section 1G $24,102.06 Sub Total Section 1G $37,337.00] $37,337.00
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1H Gate Valves Gate Valves
2" brass, threaded 6 $19.49 $116.94( 2” brass, threaded 6 $29.70 $178.20
2" cast iron, MJ with acc pak 6 $300.97 $1,805.82| 2" cast iron, MJ with acc pak 6 $227.00 $1,362.00
2" cast iron female threaded 6 $208.54 $1,251.24| 2" cast iron female threaded 6 $203.00 $1,218.00
4” cast iron, MJ with acc pak 2 $378.74 $757.48( 4” cast iron, MJ with acc pak 2 $349.00 $698.00
6" cast iron, MJ with a acc pak 10 $481.04 $4,810.40| 6” cast iron, MJ with a acc pak 10 $448.00 $4,480.00
8” cast iron, MJ with acc pak 2 $760.48 $1,520.96| 8” cast iron, MJ with acc pak 2 $702.00 $1,404.00
10" cast iron, MJ with acc pak 10 $1,207.79 $12,077.90|10” cast iron, MJ with acc pak 10 $1,091.00 $10,910.00
12” cast iron, MJ with acc pak 10 $1,501.39 $15,013.90|12” cast iron, MJ with acc pak 10 $1,373.00 $13,730.00
Sub Total Section 1H $37,354.64 Sub Total Section 1H $33,980.20| $33,980.20
1 Valve Boxes Valve Boxes
Black adjustable, black iron 18 x 24 20 $23.15 $463.00(Black adjustable, black iron 18 x 24 20 $27.50 $550.00
Valve box lid, 4” diameter 24 x 36 20 $31.60 $632.00(Valve box lid, 4” diameter 24 x 36 20 $7.00 $140.00
Adjustable valve box top, Part #/VBSTS 10 50 $9.04 $452.00| Adjustable valve box top, Part #IVBSTS 10 50 $11.00 $550.00
Adjustable valve bottom, Part #VB2612 $12.27 $0.00|Adjustable valve bottom, Part #VB2612 $13.25 $0.00
Sub Total Section 11 $1,547.00 Sub Total Section 11 $1,240.00,  $1,240.00
Section 1 Total $305,963.16 Section 1 Total $355,979.20| $355,004.20| $975.00
2A Sewer Pipe Sewer Pipe
4” SCH 40 DWV 400 $3.43 $1,372.00| 4” SCH 40 DWV 400 $2.38 $952.00
4” SDR 35 400 $0.89 $356.00| 4” SDR 35 400 $0.79 $316.00
4” SDR 26 CL 160 400 $1.27 $508.00| 4” SDR 26 CL 160 400 $1.13 $452.00
6” SDR 35 400 $1.92 $768.00| 6” SDR 35 400 $1.62 $648.00
6” SCH 40, DWV 400 $6.88 $2,752.00| 6” SCH 40, DWV 400 $3.99 $1,596.00
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6” SDR 26 CL 160 400 $2.73 $1,092.00| 6” SDR 26 CL 160 400 $2.22 $888.00
8” SDR 35 200 $3.44 $688.00( 8” SDR 35 200 $2.84 $568.00
8” SDR 26 CL 160 200 $4.64 $928.00| 8” SDR 26 CL 160 200 $3.89 $778.00
8” SCH 40 DWV 200 $10.40 $2,080.00| 8” SCH 40 DWV 200 $6.05 $1,210.00
10” SDR 35 200 $5.40 $1,080.00/10” SDR 35 200 $4.81 $962.00
10” SDR-26 CL 160 200 $7.20 $1,440.00/10” SDR-26 CL 160 200 $5.69 $1,138.00
10” SCH 40 DWV 20 $20.90 $418.00({10” SCH 40 DWV 20 $8.36 $167.20
Sub Total Section 2A $13,482.00 Sub Total Section 2A $9,675.20  $9,675.20
2B Fiberglass Manholes Fiberglass Manholes
4 ft. 2 $558.75 $1,117.50)4 ft. 2 $659.00 $1,318.00
5 ft. 2 $630.00 $1,260.00/5 ft. 2 $747.00 $1,494.00
6 ft. 2 $701.25 $1,402.50|6 ft. 2 $829.00 $1,658.00
8 ft. 2 $840.00 $1,680.00(8 ft. 2 $991.00 $1,982.00
Sub Total Section 2B $5,460.00 Sub Total Section 2B $6,452.00  $6,452.00
2C Manhole Rings & Covers Manhole Rings & Covers
Rings and covers 23.5” w/ logo 30 $175.28 $5,258.40|Rings and covers 23.5” w/ logo 30 $232.00 $6,960.00
Rings and covers 32” w/ logo 30 $226.81 $6,804.30|Rings and covers 32” w/ logo 30 $276.00 $8,280.00
Throat rings 23 1/2” diameter by 3” thick Throat rings 23 1/2” diameter by 3” thick
concrete 50 $23.63 $1,181.50|concrete 50 $23.00 $1,150.00
Sewer cleanout boot 10 $47.40 $474.00|Sewer cleanout boot 10 $47.00 $470.00
23.5” Bolted Rings and Lids w/logo 20 $721.66 $14,433.20(23.5” Bolted Rings and Lids w/logo 20 $311.00 $6,220.00
Sub Total Section 2C $28,151.40 Sub Total Section 2C $23,080.00 $23,080.00
2D In-Flow Protectors In-Flow Protectors
In-Flow Protectors 100 $65.00 $6,500.00|In-Flow Protectors 100 $23.50 $2,350.00
Sub Total Section 2D $6,500.00 Sub Total Section 2D $2,350.00,  $2,350.00
2E Manhole Rehab Sealants Manhole Rehab Sealants




CPR Services & Supplies

HD Supply & Waterworks

Section Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
Gulf States Concrete Joint Sealant 10 $46.67 $466.70|Gulf States Concrete Joint Sealant 10 No Bid $0.00
Ultra-High, single-component coal tar mastic 10 $36.00 $360.00(Ultra-High, single-component coal tar mastic 10 $40.00 $400.00
TALCO 4”w x 4”1 Rim Neck Epoxy 10 No Bid $0.00| TALCO 4”w x 4”1 Rim Neck Epoxy 10 No Bid $0.00
PAKMIX Fast Setting Concrete Mix 20 $3.81 $76.20|PAKMIX Fast Setting Concrete Mix 20 No Bid $0.00
Pro Plug 45 Stop Leak Hydraulic Cement 20 $25.30 $506.00|Pro Plug 45 Stop Leak Hydraulic Cement 20 $35.00 $700.00
Scotch Seal Brand Chemical Grout Gel #5610 20 No Bid $0.00|Scotch Seal Brand Chemical Grout Gel #5610 20 $380.00 $7,600.00
PVC Glue Quart 20 $16.33 $326.60|PVC Glue Quart 20 $7.00 $140.00
PVC Primer Quart 20 $11.70 $234.00(PVC Primer Quart 20 $6.00 $120.00

Sub Total Section 2E $1,969.50 Sub Total Section 2E $8,960.00,  $8,960.00
2F Fernco Adaptors with Clamps Fernco Adaptors with Clamps
4” pve-pve 50 $3.26 $163.00| 4” pve-pve 50 $3.30 $165.00
4” clay-pvc 50 $3.26 $163.00( 4” clay-pvc 50 $3.30 $165.00
4” concrete-pvc 50 $3.52 $176.00| 4” concrete-pvc 50 $3.50 $175.00
4” clay-concrete 10 $11.87 $118.70( 4” clay-concrete 10 $12.00 $120.00
6” pvc-pvc 20 $6.97 $139.40| 6” pve-pve 20 $7.00 $140.00
6” clay-pvc 20 $6.97 $139.40( 6” clay-pvc 20 $7.00 $140.00
6” concrete-pvc 20 $7.71 $154.20| 6” concrete-pvc 20 $7.80 $156.00
6" clay-concrete 10 $25.40 $254.00( 6” clay-concrete 10 $25.00 $250.00
8” pvc-pvc 10 $10.75 $107.50| 8” pve-pve 10 $10.80 $108.00
8” clay-pvc 10 $10.75 $107.50( 8” clay-pvc 10 $10.80 $108.00
8” concrete-pvc 10 $11.60 $116.00| 8” concrete-pvc 10 $11.70 $117.00
8” clay-concrete 10 $38.88 $388.80( 8” clay-concrete 10 $39.00 $390.00
10” pve-pve 10 $16.04 $160.4010” pve-pve 10 $16.20 $162.00
10" clay-pvc 10 $16.04 $160.40(10” clay-pvc 10 $16.20 $162.00
10 concrete-pvc 10 $16.04 $160.40{10” concrete-pvc 10 $16.20 $162.00
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10” clay-concrete 10 $52.25 $522.50|10” clay-concrete 10 $53.00 $530.00
12" pvc-pve 10 $18.70 $187.00{12” pvc-pvc 10 $19.00 $190.00
12” clay-pvc 10 $18.70 $187.00{12” clay-pvc 10 $19.00 $190.00
12" concrete-pvc 10 $18.70 $187.00{12” concrete-pvc 10 $19.00 $190.00
12" clay-concrete 10 $65.45 $654.50(12” clay-concrete 10 $66.00 $660.00
6” x 4” clay-pvc concentric 10 $8.14 $81.40(6” x 4” clay-pvc concentric 10 $8.20 $82.00
6” x 4” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $8.14 $81.40|6” x 4” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $8.20 $82.00
6" X 4” concrete-pvc concentric 10 $8.14 $81.40(6” x 4” concrete-pvc concentric 10 $8.20 $82.00
6” x 4” clay-concrete concentric 10 $30.98 $309.80(6" x 4” clay-concrete concentric 10 $31.00 $310.00
6" x 4” clay-pvc eccentric 10 $49.53 $495.30(6” x 4” clay-pvc eccentric 10 $50.00 $500.00
6” X 4” pvc-pvc eccentric 10 $49.53 $495.30(6" x 4” pvc-pvc eccentric 10 $50.00 $500.00
6" X 4” concrete-pvc eccentric 10 $49.53 $495.30(6” x 4” concrete-pvc eccentric 10 $50.00 $500.00
6” x 4” clay-concrete eccentric 10/No Bid $0.00(6” x 4” clay-concrete eccentric 10 $50.00 $500.00
8” x 4” clay-pvc concentric 10 $64.72 $647.20(8” x 4” clay-pvc concentric 10 $65.00 $650.00
8” x 4” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $53.93 $539.30(8" x 4” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $54.00 $540.00
8” X 4” concrete-pvc concentric 10 $53.80 $538.00(8” x 4” concrete-pvc concentric 10 $54.60 $546.00
8” x 4” clay-concrete concentric 10/No Bid $0.00(8” x 4” clay-concrete concentric 10 $54.60 $546.00
8” x 4” clay-pvc eccentric 10 $77.53 $775.30(8” x 4” clay-pvc eccentric 10 $78.00 $780.00
8” x 4” pvc-pvc eccentric 10 $86.13 $861.30(8" x 4” pvc-pvc eccentric 10 $87.00 $870.00
8” X 4” concrete-pvc eccentric 10 $69.75 $697.50(8” x 4” concrete-pvc eccentric 10 $70.00 $700.00
8” x 4” clay-concrete eccentric 10 $103.98 $1,039.80|8” x 4” clay-concrete eccentric 10 $105.00 $1,050.00
8” x 6” clay-pvc concentric 10 $12.90 $129.00(8” x 6” clay-pvc concentric 10 $13.00 $130.00
8” x 6” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $12.95 $129.50(8” x 6” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $13.00 $130.00
8” X 6” concrete-pvc concentric 10 $14.24 $142.40(8” x 6” concrete-pvc concentric 10 $14.00 $140.00
8” x 6” clay-concrete concentric 10 $42.25 $422.50(8” x 6” clay-concrete concentric 10 $42.00 $420.00
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10” x 8” clay-pvc eccentric 10 $122.71 $1,227.10/10” x 8” clay-pvc eccentric 10 $124.00 $1,240.00
10" x 8” pvc-pvc eccentric 10 $121.30 $1,213.00/10” x 8” pvc-pvc eccentric 10 $122.00 $1,220.00
10" x 8” concrete-pvc eccentric 10 $121.30 $1,213.00|10” x 8” concrete-pvc eccentric 10 $122.00 $1,220.00
10" x 8” clay-concrete eccentric 10 $138.18 $1,381.80|10” x 8” clay-concrete eccentric 10 $139.00 $1,390.00
10” x 8” clay-pvc concentric 10 $18.23 $182.30{10” x 8” clay-pvc concentric 10 $18.00 $180.00
10" x 8” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $17.66 $176.60{10” x 8” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $17.00 $170.00
10” x 8” concrete-pvc concentric 10 $18.91 $189.10{10” x 8” concrete-pvc concentric 10 $19.00 $190.00
10” x 8” clay-concrete concentric 10/No Bid $0.00|10” x 8” clay-concrete concentric 10 $19.00 $190.00
12” x 10" clay-pvc eccentric 10 $121.58 $1,215.80{12” x 10" clay-pvc eccentric 10 $122.00 $1,220.00
12” x 10” pvc-pvc eccentric 10 $145.90 $1,459.00|12” x 10” pvc-pvc eccentric 10 $147.00 $1,470.00
12" x 10” concrete-pvc eccentric 10 $145.90 $1,459.00|12” x 10” concrete-pvc eccentric 10 $147.00 $1,470.00
12” x 10” clay-concrete eccentric 10 $114.84 $1,148.40|12” x 10” clay-concrete eccentric 10 $116.00 $1,160.00
12” x 10” clay-pvc concentric 10 $23.66 $236.60{12” x 10" clay-pvc concentric 10 $23.00 $230.00
12” x 10” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $20.82 $208.20{12” x 10” pvc-pvc concentric 10 $21.00 $210.00
12” x 10" concrete-pvc concentric 10 $23.66 $236.60|12” x 10” concrete-pvc concentric 10 $23.00 $230.00
12" x 10” clay-concrete concentric 10 $81.61 $816.10{12” x 10” clay-concrete concentric 10 $82.00 $820.00
RUBBER TAPPING SADDLES RUBBER TAPPING SADDLES

4” TST-4 (2313-74 20 $29.30 $586.00|4” TST-4 (2313-74 20 $29.00 $580.00

Sub Total Section 2F $25,157.00 Sub Total Section 2F $26,528.00 $26,528.00
2G Backflow Preventor Backflow Preventor
4” SCH 40 10 $23.42 $234.20|4” SCH 40 10 $23.50 $235.00
6” SCH 40 10 $113.79 $1,137.90(6” SCH 40 10 $111.00 $1,110.00
Sub Total Section 2G $1,372.10 Sub Total Section 2G $1,345.00  $1,345.00
2H PVC Fittings PVC Fittings
WYE’S WYE’S




CPR Services & Supplies

HD Supply & Waterworks

Section Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
4” x 4” Sch 40 DWV 50 $7.62 $381.00{4” x 4” Sch 40 DWV 50 $7.80 $390.00
4” x 4” SDR 35 10 $3.60 $36.00{4” x 4” SDR 35 10 $3.60 $36.00
4” x4” SDR 26 10 $23.92 $239.20(4” x 4” SDR 26 10 $24.00 $240.00
6” x 4” SCH 40 DWV 5 $17.10 $85.50(6” x 4” SCH 40 DWV 5 $17.00 $85.00
6” x4” SDR 35 10 $12.65 $126.50{6” x 4” SDR 35 10 $12.80 $128.00
6” x 4” SDR 26 10 $29.60 $296.00(6” x 4” SDR 26 10 $30.00 $300.00
6” x 6” Sch 40 DWV 5 $22.50 $112.50(6” x 6” Sch 40 DWV 5 $22.80 $114.00
6” x 6” SDR 35 5 $14.51 $72.55|6” x 6” SDR 35 5 $14.70 $73.50
6” x 6” SDR 26 5 $36.31 $181.55|6” x 6” SDR 26 5 $36.00 $180.00
8” x 4” SDR 35 Double 10 $49.54 $495.40(8” x 4” SDR 35 Double 10 $50.00 $500.00
8” x 4” Sch 40 Double DWV 10 $61.64 $616.40(8” x 4” Sch 40 Double DWV 10 $62.00 $620.00
TEES TEES
6” x6” x4” SDR 35 10 $10.06 $100.60(6” x 6” x 4” SDR 35 10 $10.20 $102.00
6” x6” x 4” SDR 26 10 $29.70 $297.00(6” X 6” x 4” SDR 26 10 $30.00 $300.00
6” x6” x6” SDR 35 10 $10.65 $106.50(6” x 6” x 6” SDR 35 10 $10.80 $108.00
6” x6” x 6” SDR 26 10 $31.95 $319.50(6” x 6” x 6” SDR 26 10 $32.00 $320.00
8” x8” x6” SDR 35 10 $27.80 $278.00{8” x 8” x 6” SDR 35 10 $28.00 $280.00
8” x8” x6” SDR 26 10 $44.83 $448.30(8” x 8” x 6” SDR 26 10 $45.00 $450.00
8” x8” x 8” SDR 35 10 $41.91 $419.10(8” x 8" x 8" SDR 35 10 $42.00 $420.00
8” x 8” x 8” SDR 26 10 $66.34 $663.40(8” x 8” x 8” SDR 26 10 $67.00 $670.00
ELBOWS/BENDS Sweeping 90 Degrees ELBOWS/BENDS Sweeping 90 Degrees

4” SDR 35 10 $2.74 $27.40| 4” SDR 35 10 $2.80 $28.00
4” SDR 26 10 $19.62 $196.20| 4” SDR 26 10 $19.00 $190.00
6” SDR 40 10 No Bid $0.00( 6” SDR 40 10 $16.00 $160.00
6” SDR 35 10 $12.40 $124.00| 6” SDR 35 10 $12.00 $120.00
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6” SDR 26 10 $41.91 $419.10| 6” SDR 26 10 $42.00 $420.00
8” SDR 40 10 No Bid $0.00( 8” SDR 40 10 $24.00 $240.00
8” SDR 35 10 $52.53 $525.30 8” SDR 35 10 $53.00 $530.00
8” SDR 26 10 $84.33 $843.30( 8” SDR 26 10 $83.00 $830.00

10” SDR 40 10 $173.07 $1,730.70/10” SDR 40 10 $174.00 $1,740.00
10” SDR 35 10 $144.06 $1,440.60(10” SDR 35 10 $145.00 $1,450.00
10” SDR 26 10 $182.98 $1,829.80(10” SDR 26 10 $184.00 $1,840.00
12” SDR 40 10 $261.10 $2,611.00(12” SDR 40 10 $263.00 $2,630.00
12” SDR 35 10 $207.19 $2,071.90(12” SDR 35 10 $209.00 $2,090.00
12” SDR 26 10 $281.71 $2,817.10(12” SDR 26 10 $284.00 $2,840.00
ELBOWS/BENDS 90 Degrees ELBOWS/BENDS 90 Degrees

4” Sch 40 DWV 5 $4.61 $23.05(4” Sch 40 DWV 5 $4.65 $23.25
4” SDR 35 5 $2.19 $10.95|4” SDR 35 5 $2.20 $11.00
4” SDR 26 5 $17.63 $88.15(4” SDR 26 5 $17.80 $89.00
6” Sch 40 DWV 5 $15.66 $78.30|6” Sch 40 DWV 5 $15.80 $79.00
6” SDR 35 10 $8.05 $80.50(6” SDR 35 10 $8.00 $80.00
6” SDR 26 10 $19.60 $196.00(6” SDR 26 10 $19.80 $198.00
8” Sch 40 DWV 10 $20.90 $209.00(8” Sch 40 DWV 10 $21.00 $210.00
8” SDR 35 10 $28.57 $285.70(8” SDR 35 10 $28.00 $280.00
8” SDR 26 10 $82.29 $822.90(8” SDR 26 10 $83.00 $830.00
ELBOWS/BENDS 22 1/2 Degrees ELBOWS/BENDS 22 1/2 Degrees

4” Sch 40 DWV 20 $3.26 $65.20{4” Sch 40 DWV 20 $3.30 $66.00
4” SDR 35 10 $2.06 $20.60|4” SDR 35 10 $2.10 $21.00
4” SDR 26 10 $13.17 $131.70(4” SDR 26 10 $13.00 $130.00
6” Sch 40 DWV 10 $18.93 $189.30{6” Sch 40 DWV 10 $19.00 $190.00
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6” SDR 35 10 $9.05 $90.50|6” SDR 35 10 $9.15 $91.50
6” SDR 26 10 $24.83 $248.30(6” SDR 26 10 $25.00 $250.00
8” Sch 40 DWV 10 $52.43 $524.30(8” Sch 40 DWV 10 $52.00 $520.00
8” SDR 35 10 $23.40 $234.00(8” SDR 35 10 $23.00 $230.00
8” SDR 26 10 $44.14 $441.40(8” SDR 26 10 $44.00 $440.00
ELBOWS/BENDS 45 Degrees ELBOWS/BENDS 45 Degrees
4” Sch 40 DWV 50 $3.67 $183.50{4” Sch 40 DWV 50 $3.70 $185.00
4” SDR 35 10 $1.90 $19.00{4” SDR 35 10 $1.90 $19.00
4” SDR 26 10 $9.92 $99.20|4” SDR 26 10 $10.00 $100.00
6” Sch 40 DWV 10 $14.34 $143.40(6” Sch 40 DWV 10 $14.40 $144.00
6” SDR 35 5 $7.41 $37.05|6” SDR 35 5 $7.40 $37.00
6” SDR 26 5 $18.21 $91.05(6” SDR 26 5 $18.00 $90.00
8” Sch 40 DWV 5 $18.77 $93.85|8” Sch 40 DWV 5 $18.90 $94.50
8” SDR 35 5 $20.23 $101.15(8” SDR 35 5 $20.00 $100.00
8” SDR 26 5 $45.30 $226.50(8” SDR 26 5 $45.00 $225.00
STRAIGHT COUPLINGS STRAIGHT COUPLINGS

4” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 10 $1.92 $19.20| 4” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 10 $1.95 $19.50
4” SDR 35 Glue Joint 10 $1.26 $12.60| 4” SDR 35 Glue Joint 10 $1.25 $12.50
4” SDR 26 Glue Joint 10 $10.20 $102.00{ 4” SDR 26 Glue Joint 10 $10.00 $100.00
6” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 10 $6.08 $60.80| 6” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 10 $6.10 $61.00
6” SDR 35 Glue Joint 10 $4.54 $45.40| 6” SDR 35 Glue Joint 10 $4.60 $46.00
6” SDR 26 Glue Joint 10 $16.46 $164.60( 6” SDR 26 Glue Joint 10 $16.00 $160.00
8” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 10 $10.12 $101.20{ 8” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 10 $10.20 $102.00
8” SDR 35 Glue Joint 10 $14.18 $141.80( 8” SDR 35 Glue Joint 10 $14.30 $143.00
8” SDR 26 Glue Joint 5 $36.75 $183.75| 8” SDR 26 Glue Joint 5 $37.00 $185.00
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10” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 5 $35.44 $177.20{10” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 5 $35.00 $175.00
10” SDR 35 Glue Joint 5 $40.15 $200.75({10” SDR 35 Glue Joint 5 $40.00 $200.00
10” SDR 26 Glue Joint 5 $53.56 $267.80{10” SDR 26 Glue Joint 5 $54.00 $270.00
12” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 2 $60.06 $120.12{12” Sch 40 DWV Glue Joint 2 $61.00 $122.00
12” SDR 35 Glue Joint 2 $68.02 $136.04|12” SDR 35 Glue Joint 2 $69.00 $138.00
12” SDR 26 Glue Joint 2 $78.02 $156.04(12” SDR 26 Glue Joint 2 $79.00 $158.00
ADAPTOR, FEMALE, Threaded ADAPTOR, FEMALE, Threaded
4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $2.65 $26.50{4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $2.70 $27.00
4” SDR 35 10 $2.46 $24.60|4” SDR 35 10 $2.50 $25.00
4” SDR 26 10 $3.47 $34.70({4” SDR 26 10 $2.50 $25.00
6” Sch 40 DWV 5 $8.56 $42.80|6” Sch 40 DWV 5 $8.70 $43.50
6” SDR 35 5 $11.65 $58.25(6” SDR 35 5 $11.80 $59.00
6” SDR 26 5 $16.39 $81.95|6” SDR 26 5 $11.80 $59.00
8” Sch 40 DWV 5 $49.77 $248.85(8” Sch 40 DWV 5 $50.00 $250.00
8” SDR 35 5 $38.78 $193.90(8” SDR 35 5 $39.00 $195.00
8” SDR 26 5 No Bid $0.00(8” SDR 26 5 $39.00 $195.00
ADAPTOR, FEMALE, Clean Out, Threaded ADAPTOR, FEMALE, Clean Out, Threaded
4” Sch 40 DWV 15 $3.40 $51.00{4” Sch 40 DWV 15 $2.70 $40.50
4” SDR 35 15 $2.46 $36.90|4” SDR 35 15 $2.50 $37.50
4” SDR 26 15 $3.47 $52.05(4” SDR 26 15 $2.50 $37.50
6” Sch 40 DWV 15 $8.56 $128.40(6” Sch 40 DWV 15 $8.70 $130.50
6” SDR 35 15 $11.65 $174.75(6” SDR 35 15 $11.80 $177.00
6” SDR 26 15 $16.39 $245.85|6” SDR 26 15 $11.80 $177.00
ADAPTOR, FEMALE SPIGOT x FIP-PVC ADAPTOR, FEMALE SPIGOT x FIP-PVC
4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $3.45 $34.50|4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $2.70 $27.00
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4” SDR 35 10 $1.97 $19.70|4” SDR 35 10 $2.50 $25.00
ADAPTOR, MALE, Clean Out, Threaded ADAPTOR, MALE, Clean Out, Threaded
4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $3.85 $38.50|4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $3.90 $39.00
4” SDR 35 10 $1.94 $19.40{4” SDR 35 10 $7.40 $74.00
4” SDR 26 10 No Bid $0.00|4” SDR 26 10 $7.40 $74.00
ADAPTOR, MALE, Threaded ADAPTOR, MALE, Threaded
4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $3.85 $38.50|4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $3.90 $39.00
4” SDR 35 10 $7.38 $73.80{4” SDR 35 10 $7.40 $74.00
4” SDR 26 10 No Bid $0.00|4” SDR 26 10 $7.40 $74.00
6” Sch 40 DWV 5 $6.96 $34.80(6” Sch 40 DWV 5 $7.00 $35.00
6” SDR 35 5 $34.62 $173.10(6” SDR 35 5 $35.00 $175.00
6” SDR 26 5 No Bid $0.00(6” SDR 26 5 $35.00 $175.00
CAPS, MALE, Threaded CAPS, MALE, Threaded
4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $1.26 $12.60{4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $3.15 $31.50
4” SDR 35 10 $1.56 $15.60|4” SDR 35 10 $1.50 $15.00
4” SDR 26 10 No Bid $0.00(4” SDR 26 10 $1.50 $15.00
6” Sch 40 DWV 10 $4.02 $40.20|6” Sch 40 DWV 10 $4.00 $40.00
6” SDR 35 5 $7.53 $37.65(6” SDR 35 5 $7.60 $38.00
6” SDR 26 5 No Bid $0.00|6” SDR 26 5 $7.60 $38.00
ADAPTOR, MALE SPIGOT x MIP x slp - ADAPTOR, MALE SPIGOT x MIP x slp -

PVC PVC
4” Sch 40 DWV 10 No Bid $0.00|4” Sch 40 DWV 10 $3.90 $39.00
4” SDR 35 10 No Bid $0.00(4” SDR 35 10 $7.40 $74.00
6” Sch 40 DWV 10 No Bid $0.00|6” Sch 40 DWV 10 $7.00 $70.00
6” SDR 35 10 No Bid $0.00(6” SDR 35 10 $35.00 $350.00
Sub Total Section 2H $28,474.10 Sub Total Section 2H $30,049.75 $30,049.75
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Section 2 Total $110,566.10 Section 2 Total $108,439.95( $108,439.95
Grand Total (Sections 1 Grand Total (Sections 1
& 2) $416,529.26 &2) $464,419.15| $463,444.15  $975.00
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