L<T>OX

LEAGUE CITY

PART I Bunker Gear Advanced Cleaning, Inspection, and Repair

ITB Bid Number: 26-018
Bunker Gear Purchase, Rental, Advanced Cleaning, Inspection, and Repair
Date: January 21, 2026

Lion Safety Solutions

Extended
NFPA 1851 |Unit of P Price (250 sets,
N Unit Price
Compliant |Measurement of Bunker
Gear
Advaned
Inspection
and Price Per PPE
Advanced o= $125.80 $31,450
Cleaning
(Combined

Lion Safety Solutions

Delta Fire and Safety Fire-Dex, LLC
Extended ::tceen(dze;:)
NFPA 1851 [Unit of o Price (250 sets NFPA 1851 [Unit of o
) Unit Price N Unit Price sets of
Compliant |Measurement of Bunker Compliant [Measurement Bunker
Gear
Gear
Advaned Advaned
Inspection and Inspection and
Advan.ced Price Per PPE $189.00 447,250 Advan.ced Price Per PPE $142.20 435,500
Cleaning SET Cleaning SET
(Combined (Combined
Pricing) Pricing)
Part Il Bunker Gear Purchase
Delta Fire and Safety Fire-Dex, LLC
Item Price Per Item Item Price Per Item
No Bid
Structural Coat $2,971 Structural Coat
No Bid
Coat Add-on Options N/A Coat Add-on Options
No Bid
Structural Pants $2,066.00 Structural Pants
. . No Bid
Pant Add-on Options N/A Pant Add-on Options
Maximum Delivery Time for Maximum Delivery Time for No Bid
order 90 Days order
No Bid
Discounts N/A Discounts
No Bid
Total $5,037 Total
Part Ill Bunker Gear Rental
Delta Fire and Safety Fire-Dex, LLC Lion Safety Solutions
Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Extended
Service Description Price Cost Price Cost Unit Price Cost
PPE Rental (Coat and
Pam;" aliceatan Standard Monthly Rate PerSet | $ 29000 [ PerSet [$ 22000 | PerSet |$  249.90
Optional Item Each S 145.00 Each S 110.00 Each $ 124.95
PPE Rental Coat
Optional It
T it e ptional Item Each S 145.00 Each $ 110.00 Each S 124.95
Optional Item Each $ 80.00 Each $ 56.00 Each S 70.55
Helment
Hood Optional Item Each S 10.00 Each s 42.50 Each $ 37.40
Bunker Gloves Optional ltem Each [$  2500| (Each |$ 4250 Each s 7310
Bunker Boots Optional ltem Each |$ ~ 60.00| Each |$  39.00 Each $ 5185
. ) Optional Item Each o= Each Included Each $ -
Suspenders (if applicable Pants
. ) Each Shipment Each S 45.00 Each S - Each Included
Delivery & Pickup
. Included in Rental — Included — Included — Included
Cleaning &
Replacement of
. Per Incident Each £ Each e Each S0
Damanged Gear Attachment Attcahmnet Attachmnet
Emergency Delivery (72 "
hours) Expedited Fee Each | $ - Each [$ 30.00 Each $ -
Total Price Total Price Total Price for
for PPE Set | $§ 510.00 |for PPEset | $ 430.00 |PPE Set $ 482.80

Item Price Per Item
Structural Coat No Bid
Coat Add-on Options No Bid
Structural Pants No Bid
Pant Add-on Options No Bid
Maximum Delivery Time for
order No Bid
Discounts No Bid
Total No Bid




